H.R.1105

®ne Nundred ZEleoenth Congress
of the
Mnited States of America

AT THE FIRST SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Tuesday,
the sixth day of January, two thousand and nine

An Arct

Making omnibus appropriations for the fiscal year ending September 30, 2009,
and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Omnibus Appropriations Act,
2009”.

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.
The table of contents of this Act is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title.

Sec. 2. Table of contents.

Sec. 3. References.

Sec. 4. Explanatory statement.
Sec. 5. Statement of appropriations.

DIVISION A—AGRICULTURE, RURAL DEVELOPMENT, FOOD AND DRUG
ADMINISTRATION, AND RELATED AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Agricultural Programs

Title II—Conservation Programs

Title III—Rural Development Programs

Title IV—Domestic Food Programs

Title V—Foreign Assistance and Related Programs

Title VI—Related Agency and Food and Drug Administration
Title VII—General Provisions

DIVISION B—COMMERCE, JUSTICE, SCIENCE, AND RELATED AGENCIES
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Department of Commerce
Title II—Department of Justice
Title III—Science

Title IV—Related Agencies

Title V—General Provisions

DIVISION C—ENERGY AND WATER DEVELOPMENT AND RELATED
AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Department of Defense—Civil: Department of the Army
Title II—Department of the Interior

Title III—Department of Energy

Title IV—Independent Agencies

Title V—General Provisions

DIVISION D—FINANCIAL SERVICES AND GENERAL GOVERNMENT
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title [—Department of the Treasury

Title II—Executive Office of the President and Funds Appropriated to the President
Title III—The Judiciary

Title IV—District of Columbia

Title V—Independent Agencies



H.R.1105—2

Title VI—General Provisions—This Act
Title VII—General Provisions—Government-wide
Title VIII—General Provisions—District of Columbia

DIVISION E—DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, ENVIRONMENT, AND
RELATED AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009
Title I—Department of the Interior
Title II—Environmental Protection Agency

Title III—Related Agencies
Title IV—General Provisions

DIVISION F—DEPARTMENTS OF LABOR, HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES,
AND EDUCATION, AND RELATED AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Department of Labor

Title II—Department of Health and Human Services
Title III—Department of Education

Title IV—Related Agencies

Title V—General Provisions

Title VI—Afghan Allies Protection Act of 2009

DIVISION G—LEGISLATIVE BRANCH APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Legislative Branch Appropriations
Title II—General Provisions

DIVISION H—DEPARTMENT OF STATE, FOREIGN OPERATIONS, AND
RELATED PROGRAMS APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009

Title I—Department of State and Related Agency

Title II—United States Agency for International Development
Title III—Bilateral Economic Assistance

Title IV—International Security Assistance

Title V—Multilateral Assistance

Title VI—Export and Investment Assistance

Title VII—General Provisions

DIVISION I—TRANSPORTATION, HOUSING AND URBAN DEVELOPMENT,
AND RELATED AGENCIES APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2009
Title I—Department of Transportation
Title II—Department of Housing and Urban Development
Title III—Related Agencies
Title IV—General Provisions This Act

DIVISION J—FURTHER PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE DEPARTMENT OF
HOMELAND SECURITY AND OTHER MATTERS

SEC. 3. REFERENCES.

Except as expressly provided otherwise, any reference to “this
Act” contained in any division of this Act shall be treated as
referring only to the provisions of that division.

SEC. 4. EXPLANATORY STATEMENT.

The explanatory statement regarding this Act printed in the
House of Representatives section of the Congressional Record on
or about February 23, 2009 by the Chairman of the Committee
on Appropriations of the House shall have the same effect with
respect to the allocation of funds and implementation of this Act
£a‘ls if it were a joint explanatory statement of a committee of con-
erence.

SEC. 5. STATEMENT OF APPROPRIATIONS.

The following sums in this Act are appropriated, out of any
money in the Treasury not otherwise appropriated, for the fiscal
year ending September 30, 2009.



H.R.1105—126

(5) Judges retired under section 373 of title 28, United
States Code.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—Subsection (b) and the amendment made
by subsection (a) shall apply with respect to any payment made
on or after the first day of the first applicable pay period beginning
on or after the date of the enactment of Public Law 110-177.

SEC. 308. Subsection (c) of section 407 of the Transportation,
Treasury, Housing and Urban Development, the Judiciary, the Dis-
trict of Columbia, and Independent Agencies Appropriations Act,
2006 (division A, title IV, of Public Law 109-115; 119 Stat. 2396,
2471) is repealed.

SEC. 309. Section 203(c) of the Judicial Improvements Act of
1990 (Public Law 101-650; 28 U.S.C. 133 note), is amended—

(1) in the second sentence, by inserting “the district of
Hawaii,” after “Pennsylvania,”;

(2) in the third sentence (relating to the District of Kansas),
by striking “17 years” and inserting “18 years”;

(3) in the sixth sentence (relating to the Northern District
of Ohio), by striking “17 years” and inserting “18 years”.

(4) by inserting “The first vacancy in the office of the
district judge in the district of Hawaii occurring 15 years or
more after the confirmation date of the judge named to fill
the temporary judgeship created under this subsection shall
not be filled.” after the sixth sentence.

SEC. 310. Pursuant to section 140 of Public Law 97-92, and
from funds appropriated in this Act, Justices and judges of the
United States are authorized during fiscal year 2009, to receive
a salary adjustment in accordance with 28 U.S.C. 461.

This title may be cited as the “Judiciary Appropriations Act,
2009”.

TITLE IV
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

FEDERAL FUNDS
FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR RESIDENT TUITION SUPPORT

For a Federal payment to the District of Columbia, to be
deposited into a dedicated account, for a nationwide program to
be administered by the Mayor, for District of Columbia resident
tuition support, $35,100,000, to remain available until expended:
Provided, That such funds, including any interest accrued thereon,
may be used on behalf of eligible District of Columbia residents
to pay an amount based upon the difference between in-State and
out-of-State tuition at public institutions of higher education, or
to pay up to $2,500 each year at eligible private institutions of
higher education: Provided further, That the awarding of such funds
may be prioritized on the basis of a resident’s academic merit,
the income and need of eligible students and such other factors
as may be authorized: Provided further, That the District of
Columbia government shall maintain a dedicated account for the
Resident Tuition Support Program that shall consist of the Federal
funds appropriated to the Program in this Act and any subsequent
appropriations, any unobligated balances from prior fiscal years,
and any interest earned in this or any fiscal year: Provided further,
That the account shall be under the control of the District of



H.R.1105—127

Columbia Chief Financial Officer, who shall use those funds solely
for the purposes of carrying out the Resident Tuition Support Pro-
gram: Provided further, That the Office of the Chief Financial
Officer shall provide a quarterly financial report to the Committees
on Appropriations of the House of Representatives and the Senate
for these funds showing, by object class, the expenditures made
and the purpose therefor.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR EMERGENCY PLANNING AND SECURITY COSTS
IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

For a Federal payment of necessary expenses, as determined
by the Mayor of the District of Columbia in written consultation
with the elected county or city officials of surrounding jurisdictions,
$39,177,000, to remain available until expended and in addition
any funds that remain available from prior year appropriations
under this heading for the District of Columbia Government, of
which $38,825,000 is for the costs of providing public safety at
events related to the presence of the national capital in the District
of Columbia, for the costs of providing support requested by the
Director of the United States Secret Service Division in carrying
out protective duties under the direction of the Secretary of Home-
land Security, and for the costs of providing support to respond
to immediate and specific terrorist threats or attacks in the District
of Columbia or surrounding jurisdictions; and of which $352,000
is for the District of Columbia National Guard retention and college
access program.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA COURTS

For salaries and expenses for the District of Columbia Courts,
$248,409,000 to be allocated as follows: for the District of Columbia
Court of Appeals, $12,630,000, of which not to exceed $1,500 is
for official reception and representation expenses; for the District
of Columbia Superior Court, $104,277,000, of which not to exceed
$1,500 is for official reception and representation expenses; for
the District of Columbia Court System, $55,426,000, of which not
to exceed $1,500 is for official reception and representation
expenses; and $76,076,000, to remain available until September
30, 2010, for capital improvements for District of Columbia court-
house facilities, including structural improvements to the District
of Columbia cell block at the Moultrie Courthouse: Provided, That
funds made available for capital improvements shall be expended
consistent with the General Services Administration (GSA) master
plan study and building evaluation report: Provided further, That
notwithstanding any other provision of law, all amounts under
this heading shall be apportioned quarterly by the Office of Manage-
ment and Budget and obligated and expended in the same manner
as funds appropriated for salaries and expenses of other Federal
agencies, with payroll and financial services to be provided on
a contractual basis with the GSA, and such services shall include
the preparation of monthly financial reports, copies of which shall
be submitted directly by GSA to the President and to the Commit-
tees on Appropriations of the House of Representatives and the
Senate, the Committee on Oversight and Government Reform of
the House of Representatives, and the Committee on Homeland
Security and Governmental Affairs of the Senate: Provided further,
That 30 days after providing written notice to the Committees



H.R.1105—128

on Appropriations of the House of Representatives and the Senate,
the District of Columbia Courts may reallocate not more than
$1,000,000 of the funds provided under this heading among the
items and entities funded under this heading for operations, and
not more than 4 percent of the funds provided under this heading
for facilities.

DEFENDER SERVICES IN DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA COURTS

For payments authorized under section 11-2604 and section
11-2605, D.C. Official Code (relating to representation provided
under the District of Columbia Criminal Justice Act), payments
for counsel appointed in proceedings in the Family Court of the
Superior Court of the District of Columbia under chapter 23 of
title 16, D.C. Official Code, or pursuant to contractual agreements
to provide guardian ad litem representation, training, technical
assistance, and such other services as are necessary to improve
the quality of guardian ad litem representation, payments for
counsel appointed in adoption proceedings under chapter 3 of title
16, D.C. Code, and payments for counsel authorized under section
21-2060, D.C. Official Code (relating to representation provided
under the District of Columbia Guardianship, Protective Pro-
ceedings, and Durable Power of Attorney Act of 1986), $52,475,000,
to remain available until expended: Provided, That the funds pro-
vided in this Act under the heading “Federal Payment to the
District of Columbia Courts” (other than the $76,076,000 provided
under such heading for capital improvements for District of
Columbia courthouse facilities) may also be used for payments
under this heading: Provided further, That in addition to the funds
provided under this heading, the Joint Committee on Judicial
Administration in the District of Columbia may use funds provided
in this Act under the heading “Federal Payment to the District
of Columbia Courts” (other than the $76,076,000 provided under
such heading for capital improvements for District of Columbia
courthouse facilities), to make payments described under this
heading for obligations incurred during any fiscal year: Provided
further, That funds provided under this heading shall be adminis-
tered by the Joint Committee on Judicial Administration in the
District of Columbia: Provided further, That notwithstanding any
other provision of law, this appropriation shall be apportioned quar-
terly by the Office of Management and Budget and obligated and
expended in the same manner as funds appropriated for expenses
of other Federal agencies, with payroll and financial services to
be provided on a contractual basis with the General Services
Administration (GSA), and such services shall include the prepara-
tion of monthly financial reports, copies of which shall be submitted
directly by GSA to the President and to the Committees on Appro-
priations of the House of Representatives and the Senate, the
Committee on Oversight and Government Reform of the House
of Representatives, and the Committee on Homeland Security and
Governmental Affairs of the Senate.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE COURT SERVICES AND OFFENDER
SUPERVISION AGENCY FOR THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

For salaries and expenses, including the transfer and hire
of motor vehicles, of the Court Services and Offender Supervision
Agency for the District of Columbia, as authorized by the National



H.R.1105—129

Capital Revitalization and Self-Government Improvement Act of
1997, $203,490,000, of which not to exceed $2,000 is for official
reception and representation expenses related to Community Super-
vision and Pretrial Services Agency programs; of which not to
exceed $25,000 is for dues and assessments relating to the
implementation of the Court Services and Offender Supervision
Agency Interstate Supervision Act of 2002; of which not to exceed
$400,000 for the Community Supervision Program and $160,000
for the Pretrial Services Program, both to remain available until
September 30, 2010, are for information technology infrastructure
enhancement acquisitions; of which $148,652,000 shall be for nec-
essary expenses of Community Supervision and Sex Offender Reg-
istration, to include expenses relating to the supervision of adults
subject to protection orders or the provision of services for or related
to such persons; of which $54,838,000 shall be available to the
Pretrial Services Agency: Provided, That notwithstanding any other
provision of law, all amounts under this heading shall be appor-
tioned quarterly by the Office of Management and Budget and
obligated and expended in the same manner as funds appropriated
for salaries and expenses of other Federal agencies: Provided fur-
ther, That not less than $2,000,000 shall be available for re-entrant
housing in the District of Columbia: Provided further, That the
Director is authorized to accept and use gifts in the form of in-
kind contributions of space and hospitality to support offender
and defendant programs, and equipment and vocational training
services to educate and train offenders and defendants: Provided
further, That the Director shall keep accurate and detailed records
of the acceptance and use of any gift or donation under the previous
proviso, and shall make such records available for audit and public
inspection: Provided further, That the Court Services and Offender
Supervision Agency Director is authorized to accept and use
reimbursement from the District of Columbia Government for space
and services provided on a cost reimbursable basis.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA PUBLIC DEFENDER
SERVICE

For salaries and expenses, including the transfer and hire
of motor vehicles, of the District of Columbia Public Defender
Service, as authorized by the National Capital Revitalization and
Self-Government Improvement Act of 1997, $35,659,000, of which
$700,000 is to remain available until September 30, 2010: Provided,
That notwithstanding any other provision of law, all amounts under
this heading shall be apportioned quarterly by the Office of Manage-
ment and Budget and obligated and expended in the same manner
as funds appropriated for salaries and expenses of Federal agencies.
Provided further, That for fiscal year 2009 and thereafter, the
Public Defender Service is authorized to charge fees to cover costs
of materials distributed and training provided to attendees of edu-
cational events, including conferences, sponsored by the Public
Defender Service, and notwithstanding 31 U.S.C. 3302, such fees
shall be credited to this account, to be available until expended
without further appropriation.



H.R.1105—130

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA WATER AND
SEWER AUTHORITY

For a Federal payment to the District of Columbia Water
and Sewer Authority, $16,000,000, to remain available until
expended, to continue implementation of the Combined Sewer Over-
flow Long-Term Plan: Provided, That the District of Columbia Water
and Sewer Authority provides a 100 percent match for this payment.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE CRIMINAL JUSTICE COORDINATING
COUNCIL

For a Federal payment to the Criminal Justice Coordinating
Council, $1,774,000, to remain available until expended, to support
initiatives related to the coordination of Federal and local criminal
justice resources in the District of Columbia.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE OFFICE OF THE CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER
OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

For a Federal payment to the Office of the Chief Financial
Officer of the District of Columbia, $4,887,622: Provided, That each
entity that receives funding under this heading shall submit to
the Office of the Chief Financial Officer of the District of Columbia
(CFO) a detailed budget and comprehensive description of the activi-
ties to be carried out with such funds no later than 60 days
after enactment of this Act, and the CFO shall submit a comprehen-
sive report to the Committees on Appropriations of the House
of Representatives and the Senate no later than June 1, 2009.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT

For a Federal payment for a school improvement program
in the District of Columbia, $54,000,000, to be allocated as follows:
for the District of Columbia Public Schools, $20,000,000 to improve
public school education in the District of Columbia; for the State
Education Office, $20,000,000 to expand quality public charter
schools in the District of Columbia, to remain available until
expended; for the Secretary of the Department of Education,
$14,000,000 to provide opportunity scholarships for students in
the District of Columbia in accordance with division C, title III
of the District of Columbia Appropriations Act, 2004 (Public Law
108-199; 118 Stat. 126), of which up to $1,000,000 may be used
to administer and fund assessments: Provided, That none of the
funds provided in this Act or any other Act for opportunity scholar-
ships may be used by an eligible student to enroll in a participating
school under the D.C. School Choice Incentive Act of 2003 unless
(1) the participating school has and maintains a valid certificate
of occupancy issued by the District of Columbia; and (2) the core
subject matter teachers of the eligible student hold 4-year bachelor’s
degrees: Provided further, That use of any funds in this Act or
any other Act for opportunity scholarships after school year 2009—
2010 shall only be available upon enactment of reauthorization
of that program by Congress and the adoption of legislation by
the District of Columbia approving such reauthorization.



H.R.1105—131

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO JUMP START PUBLIC SCHOOL REFORM

For a Federal payment to jump start public school reform
in the District of Columbia, $20,000,000, of which $3,500,000 is
to support the recruitment, development and training of principals
and other school leaders; $7,000,000 is to develop optimal school
programs and intervene in low performing schools; $7,500,000 is
for a customized data reporting and accountability system on stu-
dent performance as well as increased outreach and training for
parents and community members; and $2,000,000 is to support
data reporting requirements associated with the District of
Columbia Public Schools teacher incentive program: Provided, That
up to $500,000 or 10 percent, whichever is less, of the amounts
above may be transferred as necessary from one activity to another
activity: Provided further, That the Committees on Appropriations
of the House of Representatives and Senate are notified in writing
15 days in advance of the transfer: Provided further, That any
amount provided under this heading shall be available only after
such amount has been apportioned pursuant to chapter 15 of title
31, United States Code.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR CONSOLIDATED LABORATORY FACILITY

For a Federal payment to the District of Columbia, $21,000,000,
to remain available until September 30, 2010, for costs associated
with the construction of a consolidated bioterrorism and forensics
laboratory: Provided, That the District of Columbia provides a 100
percent match for this payment.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR CENTRAL LIBRARY AND BRANCH LOCATIONS

For a Federal payment to the District of Columbia, $7,000,000,
to remain available until expended, for the Federal contribution
for costs associated with the renovation and rehabilitation of District
libraries.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE MAYOR OF THE
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

For a Federal payment to the Executive Office of the Mayor
of the District of Columbia to enhance the quality of life for District
residents, $3,387,500, of which $1,250,000 shall be available as
matching funds to temporarily continue Federal benefits for low-
income couples who decide to marry, and of which $2,137,500 shall
be to continue Marriage Development Accounts in the District of
Columbia: Provided, That no funds shall be expended until the
Mayor of the District of Columbia submits a detailed expenditure
plan, including performance measures, to the Committees on Appro-
priations of the House of Representatives and the Senate: Provided
further, That the District submit a preliminary progress report
on activities no later than June 1, 2009, and a final report including
a detailed description of outcomes achieved no later than February
1, 2010.

DisTrICT OF COLUMBIA FUNDS

The following amounts are appropriated for the District of
Columbia for the current fiscal year out of the General Fund of
the District of Columbia (“General Fund”), except as otherwise



H.R.1105—132

specifically provided: Provided, That notwithstanding any other
provision of law, except as provided in section 450A of the District
of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved November 2, 2000 (114
Stat. 2440; D.C. Official Code §1-204.50a), and provisions of this
Act, the total amount appropriated in this Act for operating
expenses for the District of Columbia for fiscal year 2009 under
this heading shall not exceed the lesser of the sum of the total
revenues of the District of Columbia for such fiscal year or
$9,888,095,000 (of which $6,082,474,000 shall be from local funds
(including $420,119,000 from dedicated taxes), $2,177,382,000 shall
be from Federal grant funds, $1,621,929,000 shall be from other
funds, and $6,310,000 shall be from private funds); in addition,
$202,326,130 from funds previously appropriated in this Act as
Federal payments: Provided further, That of the local funds, such
amounts as may be necessary may be derived from the District’s
General Fund balance: Provided further, That of these funds the
District’s intradistrict authority shall be $725,461,000: in addition,
for capital construction projects, an increase of $1,482,977,000, of
which $1,121,734,000 shall be from local funds, $107,794,000 from
the Local Street Maintenance fund, $60,708,000 from the District
of Columbia Highway Trust Fund, $192,741,000 from Federal grant
funds, and a rescission of $353,447,000 from local funds and a
rescission of $37,500,000 from Local Street Maintenance funds
appropriated under this heading in prior fiscal years for a net
amount of $1,092,030,000 to remain available until expended: Pro-
vided further, That the amounts provided under this heading are
to be available, allocated and expended as proposed under “Title
III—District of Columbia Funds Division of Expenses” of the Fiscal
Year 2009 Proposed Budget and Financial Plan submitted to the
Congress by the District of Columbia on June 9, 2008 and such
title is hereby incorporated by reference as though set forth fully
herein: Provided further, That this amount may be increased by
proceeds of one-time transactions which are expended for emergency
or unanticipated operating or capital needs: Provided further, That
such increases shall be approved by enactment of local District
law and shall comply with all reserve requirements contained in
the District of Columbia Home Rule Act approved December 24,
1973 (87 Stat. 777; D.C. Official Code §1-201.01 et seq.), as
amended by this Act: Provided further, That the Chief Financial
Officer of the District of Columbia shall take such steps as are
necessary to assure that the District of Columbia meets these
requirements, including the apportioning by the Chief Financial
Officer of the appropriations and funds made available to the Dis-
trict during fiscal year 2009, except that the Chief Financial Officer
may not reprogram for operating expenses any funds derived from
bonds, notes, or other obligations issued for capital projects.

This title may be cited as the “District of Columbia Appropria-
tions Act, 2009”.



[House Appropriations Committee Print]

Omnibus Appropriations Act, 2009
(H.R. 1105; Public Law 111-8)

DIVISION D—FINANCIAL SERVICES AND GEN-
ERAL GOVERNMENT APPROPRIATIONS ACT,
2009

(871)



943

“(3) to the extent practicable, at the same time and in the
same manner as would basic pay if such employee’s civilian
employment had not been interrupted.

“(d) The Office of Personnel Management shall, in consultation
with Secretary of Defense, prescribe any regulations necessary to
carry out the preceding provisions of this section.

“(e)(1) The head of each agency referred to in section
2302(a)(2)(C)(ii) shall, in consultation with the Office, prescribe
procedures to ensure that the rights under this section apply to the
employees of such agency.

“(2) The Administrator of the Federal Aviation Administration
shall, in consultation with the Office, prescribe procedures to en-
sure that the rights under this section apply to the employees of
that agency.

“(f) For purposes of this section—

“(1) the terms ‘employee’, ‘Federal Government’, and ‘uni-
formed services’ have the same respective meanings as given
those terms in section 4303 of title 38;

“(2) the term ‘employing agency’, as used with respect to
an employee entitled to any payments under this section,
means the agency or other entity of the Government (including
an agency referred to in section 2302(a)(2)(C)(ii)) with respect
to which such employee has reemployment rights under chap-
ter 43 of title 38; and

“(3) the term ‘basic pay’ includes any amount payable
under section 5304.”.

(b) TECHNICAL AND CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—The table of
sections for chapter 55 of title 5, United States Code, is amended
by inserting after the item relating to section 5537 the following:

“5538. Nonreduction in pay while serving in the uniformed services or National
Guard.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section
shall apply with respect to pay periods (as described in section
5538(b) of title 5, United States Code, as amended by this section)
beginning on or after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 752. Not later than 120 days after enactment of this Act,
each executive department and agency shall submit to the Director
of the Office of Management and Budget a report stating the total
size of its workforce, differentiated by number of civilian, military,
and contract workers as of December 31, 2008. Not later than 180
days after enactment of this Act, the Director of the Office of Man-
agement and Budget shall submit to the Committee a comprehen-
sive statement delineating the workforce data by individual depart-
ment and agency, as well as aggregate totals of civilian, military,
and contract workers.

TITLE VIII

GENERAL PROVISIONS—DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

SEC. 801. Whenever in this Act, an amount is specified within
an appropriation for particular purposes or objects of expenditure,
such amount, unless otherwise specified, shall be considered as the



944

maximum amount that may be expended for said purpose or object
rather than an amount set apart exclusively therefor.

SEC. 802. Appropriations in this Act shall be available for ex-
penses of travel and for the payment of dues of organizations con-
cerned with the work of the District of Columbia government, when
authorized by the Mayor, or, in the case of the Council of the Dis-
trict of Columbia, funds may be expended with the authorization
of the Chairman of the Council.

SEC. 803. There are appropriated from the applicable funds of
the District of Columbia such sums as may be necessary for mak-
ing refunds and for the payment of legal settlements or judgments
that have been entered against the District of Columbia govern-
ment.

SEC. 804. (a) None of the Federal funds provided in this Act
shall be used for publicity or propaganda purposes or implementa-
tion of any policy including boycott designed to support or defeat
legislation pending before Congress or any State legislature.

(b) The District of Columbia may use local funds provided in
this title to carry out lobbying activities on any matter.

SEC. 805. (a) None of the funds provided under this Act to the
agencies funded by this Act, both Federal and District government
agencies, that remain available for obligation or expenditure in fis-
cal year 2009, or provided from any accounts in the Treasury of the
United States derived by the collection of fees available to the
agencies funded by this Act, shall be available for obligation or ex-
penditures for an agency through a reprogramming of funds
which—

(1) creates new programs;

(2) eliminates a program, project, or responsibility center;

(3) establishes or changes allocations specifically denied,
limited or increased under this Act;

(4) increases funds or personnel by any means for any pro-
gram, project, or responsibility center for which funds have
been denied or restricted,;

(5) reestablishes any program or project previously de-
ferred through reprogramming;

(6) augments any existing program, project, or responsi-
bility center through a reprogramming of funds in excess of
$3,000,000 or 10 percent, whichever is less; or

(7) increases by 20 percent or more personnel assigned to
a specific program, project or responsibility center,

unless in the case of Federal funds, the Committees on Appropria-
tions of the House of Representatives and the Senate are notified
in writing 15 days in advance of the reprogramming and in the
case of local funds, the Committees on Appropriations of the House
of Representatives and the Senate are provided summary reports
on April 1, 2009 and October 1, 2009, setting forth detailed infor-
mation regarding each such local funds reprogramming conducted
subject to this subsection.

(b) None of the local funds contained in this Act may be avail-
able for obligation or expenditure for an agency through a transfer
of any local funds in excess of $3,000,000 from one appropriation
heading to another unless the Committees on Appropriations of the
House of Representatives and the Senate are provided summary re-



945

ports on April 1, 2009 and October 1, 2009, setting forth detailed
information regarding each reprogramming conducted subject to
this subsection.

(c) The District of Columbia government is authorized to ap-
prove and execute reprogramming and transfer requests of local
funds under this title through December 1, 2009.

SeEc. 806. Consistent with the provisions of section 1301(a) of
title 31, United States Code, appropriations under this Act shall be
applied only to the objects for which the appropriations were made
except as otherwise provided by law.

SEcC. 807. None of the Federal funds made available in this Act
may be used to implement or enforce the Health Care Benefits Ex-
pansion Act of 1992 (D.C. Law 9-114; D.C. Official Code, sec. 32—
701 et seq.) or to otherwise implement or enforce any system of
registration of unmarried, cohabiting couples, including but not
limited to registration for the purpose of extending employment,
health, or governmental benefits to such couples on the same basis
that such benefits are extended to legally married couples.

SEC. 808. (a) Section 446B(f) of the District of Columbia Home
Rule Act (sec. 1-204.46b(f), D.C. Official Code) is amended by strik-
ing “fiscal years 2006 through 2008” and inserting “fiscal year 2006
and each succeeding fiscal year”.

(b) The amendment made by subsection (a) shall take effect as
if included in the enactment of the 2005 District of Columbia Om-
nibus Authorization Act.

SEC. 809. None of the Federal funds provided in this Act may
be used by the District of Columbia to provide for salaries, ex-
penses, or other costs associated with the offices of United States
Senator or United States Representative under section 4(d) of the
District of Columbia Statehood Constitutional Convention Initia-
tives of 1979 (D.C. Law 3-171; D.C. Official Code, sec. 1-123).

SEC. 810. Except as otherwise provided in this section, none of
the funds made available by this Act or by any other Act may be
used to provide any officer or employee of the District of Columbia
with an official vehicle unless the officer or employee uses the vehi-
cle only in the performance of the officer’s or employee’s official du-
ties. For purposes of this section, the term “official duties” does not
include travel between the officer’s or employee’s residence and
workplace, except in the case of—

(1) an officer or employee of the Metropolitan Police De-
partment who resides in the District of Columbia or a District
of Columbia government employee as may otherwise be des-
ignated by the Chief of the Department;

(2) at the discretion of the Fire Chief, an officer or em-
ployee of the District of Columbia Fire and Emergency Medical
Services Department who resides in the District of Columbia
and is on call 24 hours a day or is otherwise designated by the
Fire Chief;

(3) at the discretion of the Director of the Department of
Corrections, an officer or employee of the District of Columbia
Department of Corrections who resides in the District of Co-
lumbia and is on call 24 hours a day or is otherwise designated
by the Director;

(4) the Mayor of the District of Columbia; and



946

b (5) the Chairman of the Council of the District of Colum-
ia.

SEC. 811. (a) None of the Federal funds contained in this Act
may be used by the District of Columbia Attorney General or any
other officer or entity of the District government to provide assist-
ance for any petition drive or civil action which seeks to require
Congress to provide for voting representation in Congress for the
District of Columbia.

(b) Nothing in this section bars the District of Columbia Attor-
ney General from reviewing or commenting on briefs in private
lawsuits, or from consulting with officials of the District govern-
ment regarding such lawsuits.

SEC. 812. None of the Federal funds contained in this Act may
be used for any program of distributing sterile needles or syringes
for the hypodermic injection of any illegal drug.

SEC. 813. Nothing in this Act may be construed to prevent the
Council or Mayor of the District of Columbia from addressing the
issue of the provision of contraceptive coverage by health insurance
plans, but it is the intent of Congress that any legislation enacted
on such issue should include a “conscience clause” which provides
exceptions for religious beliefs and moral convictions.

SEc. 814. (a) Notwithstanding section 61531)(3)(B) of the Indi-
viduals With Disabilities Education Act (20 U.S.C. 14153G)(3)(B)),
none of the funds contained in this Act or in any other Act making
appropriations for the government of the District of Columbia for
fiscal year 2009 or any succeeding fiscal year may be made avail-
able—

(1) to pay the fees of an attorney who represents a party
in or defends an IDEA proceeding which was initiated prior to
the date of the enactment of this Act in an amount in excess
of $4,000 for that proceeding; or

(2) to pay the fees of an attorney or firm who represents
a party in or defends an IDEA proceeding if the Chief Finan-
cial Officer of the District of Columbia determines that the at-
torney or firm has a pecuniary interest (either directly or
through an attorney, officer, or employee of the firm) in any
special education diagnostic services or schools or other special
education service providers.

(b) In this section, the term “IDEA proceeding” means any ac-
tion or administrative proceeding (including any ensuing or related
proceedings before a court of competent jurisdiction) brought
against the District of Columbia Public Schools under the Individ-
uals with Disabilities Education Act (20 U.S.C. 1400 et seq.).

SEc. 815. The Mayor of the District of Columbia shall submit
to the Committees on Appropriations of the House of Representa-
tives and the Senate, the Committee on Oversight and Government
Reform of the House of Representatives, and the Committee on
Homeland Security and Governmental Affairs of the Senate annual
reports addressing—

(1) crime, including the homicide rate, implementation of
community policing, the number of police officers on local
beats, and the closing down of open-air drug markets;

(2) access to substance and alcohol abuse treatment, in-
cluding the number of treatment slots, the number of people



947

served, the number of people on waiting lists, and the effective-

ness of treatment programs, the retention rates in treatment

programs, and the recidivism/re-arrest rates for treatment par-
ticipants;

(3) management of parolees and pre-trial violent offenders,
including the number of halfway houses escapes and steps
taken to improve monitoring and supervision of halfway house
residents to reduce the number of escapes to be provided in
consultation with the Court Services and Offender Supervision
Agency for the District of Columbia;

(4) education, including access to special education services
and student achievement to be provided in consultation with
the District of Columbia Public Schools and the District of Co-
lumbia public charter schools, repeated grade rates, high
school graduation rates, post-secondary education attendance
rates, and teen pregnancy rates;

(5) improvement in basic District services, including rat
control and abatement;

(6) application for and management of Federal grants, in-
cluding the number and type of grants for which the District
was eligible but failed to apply and the number and type of
grants awarded to the District but for which the District failed
to spend the amounts received;

(7) indicators of child and family well-being including child
living arrangements by family structure, number of children
aging out of foster care, poverty rates by family structure,
crime by family structure, marriage rates by income quintile,
and out-of-wedlock births; and

(8) employment, including job status and participation in
assistance programs by income, education and family struc-
ture.

SEC. 816. Beginning in fiscal year 2009 and each fiscal year
thereafter, the amount appropriated to the District of Columbia
may be increased by no more than $100,000,000 from funds identi-
fied in the annual comprehensive annual financial report as the
District’s immediately preceding fiscal year’s unexpended general
fund surplus. The District may obligate and expend these amounts
only in accordance with the following conditions:

(1) The Chief Financial Officer of the District of Columbia
shall certify that the use of any such amounts is not antici-
pated to have a negative impact on the District’s long-term fi-
nancial, fiscal, and economic vitality.

(2) The District of Columbia may only use these funds for
the following expenditures:

(A) One-time expenditures.

(B) Expenditures to avoid deficit spending.
(C) Debt Reduction.

(D) Program needs.

(E) Expenditures to avoid revenue shortfalls.

(3) The amounts shall be obligated and expended in ac-
cordance with laws enacted by the Council in support of each
such obligation or expenditure.



948

(4) The amounts may not be used to fund the agencies of
the District of Columbia government under court ordered re-
ceivership.

(5) The amounts may not be obligated or expended unless
the Mayor notifies the Committees on Appropriations of the
House of Representatives and the Senate not fewer than 30
days in advance of the obligation or expenditure.

SEC. 817. (a) Beginning in fiscal year 2009 and each fiscal year
thereafter, consistent with revenue collections, the amount appro-
priated as District of Columbia Funds may be increased—

(1) by an aggregate amount of not more than 25 percent,
in the case of amounts proposed to be allocated as “Other-Type
Funds” in the annual Proposed Budget and Financial Plan sub-
mitted to Congress by the District of Columbia; and

(2) by an aggregate amount of not more than 6 percent, in
the case of any other amounts proposed to be allocated in such
Proposed Budget and Financial Plan.

(b) The District of Columbia may obligate and expend any in-
crease in the amount of funds authorized under this section only
in accordance with the following conditions:

(1) The Chief Financial Officer of the District of Columbia
shall certify—

(A) the increase in revenue; and

(B) that the use of the amounts is not anticipated to
have a negative impact on the long-term financial, fiscal,
or economic health of the District.

(2) The amounts shall be obligated and expended in ac-
cordance with laws enacted by the Council of the District of
Columbia in support of each such obligation and expenditure,
consistent with the requirements of this Act.

(3) The amounts may not be used to fund any agencies of
the District government operating under court-ordered receiv-
ership.

(4) The amounts may not be obligated or expended unless
the Mayor has notified the Committees on Appropriations of
the House of Representatives and the Senate not fewer than 30
days in advance of the obligation or expenditure.

SEC. 818. Beginning in fiscal year 2009 and each fiscal year
thereafter, the Chief Financial Officer for the District of Columbia
may, for the purpose of cash flow management, conduct short-term
borrowing from the emergency reserve fund and from the contin-
gency reserve fund established under section 450A of the District
of Columbia Home Rule Act (Public Law 93-198): Provided, That
the amount borrowed shall not exceed 50 percent of the total
amount of funds contained in both the emergency and contingency
reserve funds at the time of borrowing: Provided further, That the
borrowing shall not deplete either fund by more than 50 percent:
Provided further, That 100 percent of the funds borrowed shall be
replenished within 9 months of the time of the borrowing or by the
end of the fiscal year, whichever occurs earlier: Provided further,
That in the event that short-term borrowing has been conducted
and the emergency or the contingency reserve funds are later de-
pleted below 50 percent as a result of an emergency or contingency,
an amount equal to the amount necessary to restore reserve levels



949

to 50 percent of the total amount of funds contained in both the
emergency and contingency reserve fund must be replenished from
the amount borrowed within 60 days.

SEc. 819. (a) None of the funds contained in this Act may be
used to enact or carry out any law, rule, or regulation to legalize
or otherwise reduce penalties associated with the possession, use,
or distribution of any schedule I substance under the Controlled
Substances Act (21 U.S.C. 801 et seq.) or any
tetrahydrocannabinols derivative.

(b) The Legalization of Marijuana for Medical Treatment Ini-
tiative of 1998, also known as Initiative 59, approved by the elec-
tors of the District of Columbia on November 3, 1998, shall not
take effect.

SEC. 820. None of the funds appropriated under this Act shall
be expended for any abortion except where the life of the mother
would be endangered if the fetus were carried to term or where the
pregnancy is the result of an act of rape or incest.

SEC. 821. Amounts appropriated in this Act as operating funds
may be transferred to the District of Columbia’s enterprise and
capital funds and such amounts, once transferred shall retain ap-
propriation authority consistent with the provisions of this Act.

SEC. 822. (a) INCREASE IN THE HOURLY RATE FOR ATTORNEYS
REPRESENTING INDIGENT DEFENDANTS IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUM-
BIA COURTS.—Section 11-2604(a), District of Columbia Official
Code, is amended by striking “$80 per hour” and inserting “$90 per
hour”.

(b) SPECIAL RULE FOR COMPENSATION OF ATTORNEYS IN NE-
GLECT AND TERMINATION OF PARENTAL RIGHTS PROCEEDINGS.—Sec-
tion 16-2326.01(b), District of Columbia Official Code, is amend-
ed—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “$1,760” and inserting

“$1,980”;

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “$1,760” and inserting
“$1,980”;

(3) in paragraph (3), by striking “$2,400” and inserting
“$2,700”; and
; (4) in paragraph (4), by striking “$1,200” and inserting
“$1,350”.

(c) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section
shall apply with respect to cases and proceedings initiated on or
after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 823. Section 2 of the Act entitled “An Act Relative to the
control of wharf property and certain public spaces in the District
of Columbia”, approved March 3, 1899 (sec. 10-501.02(a), D.C. Offi-
cial Code) is amended by striking the last sentence.

SEC. 824. Except as expressly provided otherwise, any ref-
erence to “this Act” contained in this title or in title IV shall be
treated as referring only to the provisions of this title or of title IV.

This division may be cited as the “Financial Services and Gen-
eral Government Appropriations Act, 2009”.



973

Section 307 includes language intended to provide equal treat-
ment for Federal judges regarding life insurance premiums.

Section 308 extends the sunset provision for certain procurement
authorities.

Section 309 extends the term of temporary judgeships in Kansas,
Northern Ohio, and Hawaii for one year.

Section 310 authorizes a cost of living adjustment for fiscal year
2009 for Federal judges.

TITLE IV
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

FEDERAL FUNDS
FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR RESIDENT TUITION SUPPORT

The bill includes $35,100,000 for a Federal payment for tuition
support. The District of Columbia is expected to adhere to the au-
thorizing statute with regard to the administrative expenses associ-
ated with operation of this program.

The Mayor of the District of Columbia and the State Education
Office are directed to institute cost containment measures and re-
port regularly on these efforts. Additionally, the District of Colum-
bia is directed to explore other funding options to augment the Fed-
eral investment for this program. The District of Columbia is ex-
pected to address any insufficiency in funding through ratable re-
ductions and other adjustments or prioritizations based on the in-
come and need of eligible students.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR EMERGENCY PLANNING AND SECURITY COSTS
IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

The bill provides $39,177,000 for a Federal payment to the Dis-
trict of Columbia for the costs associated with emergency planning
and security. Within the amount provided, $352,000 is for the Dis-
trict of Columbia National Guard for a tuition assistance program.

Due to estimates of the unprecedented number of people who vis-
ited Washington, DC for the Presidential Inauguration, and the
stress this event placed on the resources of the nation’s capital, the
bill provides $38,825,000 for security and planning for this event.
This is $23,825,000 more than the amount originally requested by
the President and the District of Columbia. While all reports indi-
cate that this event was unmatched in size, it may take some time
for the actual costs to the District of Columbia to be clear. It is for
that reason that the District of Columbia is urged to report to the
House and Senate Committees on Appropriations once the actual
costs to the city are known. The District of Columbia is expected
to include information about the amounts and other sources of Fed-
eral funding that were made available, or are anticipated, as a re-
sult of this event being designated a Federal emergency, when re-
porting to the Committees.

Beginning in fiscal year 2010, the District of Columbia govern-
ment is directed to submit a detailed budget justification with the
funding request for this account. The District of Columbia is also
directed to provide a report to the House and Senate Committees



974

on Appropriations, within 60 days of the end of the fiscal year, out-
lining the purposes and amounts expended using the funds, with
attention given to detailing any deviation from the initial justifica-
tion.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA COURTS

The bill provides $248,409,000 as a Federal payment to the Dis-
trict of Columbia Courts. Within this amount, $12,630,000 is for
the District of Columbia Court of Appeals, $104,277,000 is for the
District of Columbia Superior Court, §55,426,000 is for the District
of Columbia Court System and $76,076,000 is for capital improve-
ments to Court facilities. Increases for capital improvements above
the amount requested in the President’s budget should be directed
to renovations for the Moultrie Courthouse cell block. The Courts
are directed to keep the House and Senate Committees on Appro-
priations informed on the status of the capital renovations, includ-
ing schedule delays and significant cost increases.

DEFENDER SERVICES IN DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA COURTS

The bill includes $52,475,000 for Defender Services in the Dis-
trict of Columbia. This amount is intended to provide an increase
in the reimbursement rate for attorneys to $90 per hour.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE COURT SERVICES AND OFFENDER
SUPERVISION AGENCY FOR THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

The bill provides $203,490,000 for a Federal payment to the
goilrt Egrvices and Offender Supervision Agency for the District of
olumbia.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA PUBLIC DEFENDER
SERVICE

The bill includes $35,659,000 for a Federal payment to the Dis-
trict of Columbia Public Defender Service. Of the amounts pro-
vided, $700,000 is available until September 30, 2010 for the mov-
ing expenses of the Mental Health Division.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA WATER AND
SEWER AUTHORITY

The bill provides $16,000,000 for a Federal payment for the Dis-
trict of Columbia Water and Sewer Authority (WASA). WASA is di-
rected to provide a 100 percent match for these funds.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE CRIMINAL JUSTICE COORDINATING
COUNCIL

The bill provides $1,774,000 to the Criminal Justice Coordinating
Council (CJCC). The CJCC is directed to report annually on per-
formance measures and individual initiatives to the House and
Senate Committees on Appropriations.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE OFFICE OF THE CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER
OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

The bill provides $4,887,622 for a Federal payment to the Office
of the Chief Financial Officer of the District of Columbia. The fund-



975

ing is for grants to the following organizations with the require-
ment that the funds be spent primarily in the District of Columbia
to benefit District residents:

Project Name Amount
“I Have A Dream” Foundation of Washington DC, Brent Dream

Class 0f 2006 ......cooueiriiiiiiiieeieeete et e $82,536
Boys and Girls Club of Greater Washington for Project Learn ......... 100,000
Capital Area Food Bank Facility Construction ...........ccccceveeevveeennenn. 196,514
Children’s National Medical Center, pediatric surgical center ren-

OVALIONS 1uuiiiiiiieee it ee e e ettt e e e e ee ettt ee e e e e eeratbaeeeeeeesnnssaaeeeeeennnnnanes 2,850,000
DC Campaign for Literacy Education (CYCLE) ......cccecciiviiiiiiennens 82,536
Educational Advancement Alliance for the DC Student Support

Services Project ......occcvvvvoiiiiiiieieiie e 245,643
Everybody WInNs! ..ot 225,000
Excel—Automotive Workforce Development Training Program ........ 294,772
Georgetown Metro Connection ...........ccceccueeeeceieeinieeennieeensneeeeieeessnneens 98,257
National Children’s Alliance ..........cccocveeeeeeeecnvveeeeeeennn. 245,643
Safe Kids Worldwide, Inc., Child Safety Initiative 368,464
The Perry School for an Economic Empowerment Program 98,257

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR SCHOOL IMPROVEMENT

The bill includes $54,000,000 for a Federal payment for school
improvement, an increase of $13,200,000 over the fiscal year 2008
enacted level. Within this amount, $20,000,000 is for public
schools, $20,000,000 is for public charter schools, and $14,000,000
is to provide opportunity scholarships.

Funding provided for the private scholarship program shall be
used for currently-enrolled participants rather than new appli-
cants. The Chancellor of the District of Columbia Public Schools
should promptly take steps to minimize potential disruption and
ensure smooth transition for any students seeking enrollment in
the public school system as a result of any changes made to the pri-
vate scholarship program affecting periods after school year 2009—
2010.

The District is directed to submit, no later than 60 days after en-
actment of this Act, a detailed budget proposal outlining specific
activities for use of the funds provided for public charter school fa-
cilities, school-level grants to improve academic performance, and
the replication of existing high-quality public charter schools in the
District.

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO JUMP-START PUBLIC SCHOOL REFORM

The bill includes $20,000,000 as a one-time Federal payment to
jump-start public school reform, as requested by the President.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR CONSOLIDATED LABORATORY FACILITY

The bill provides $21,000,000 for a Federal payment for a consoli-
dated laboratory facility, $16,000,000 more than both the fiscal
year 2008 enacted level and the President’s budget request, to ex-
pedite construction of the lab.

FEDERAL PAYMENT FOR CENTRAL LIBRARY AND BRANCH LOCATIONS

The bill provides $7,000,000 for a Federal payment to the Dis-
trict of Columbia for a central library and branch locations.



976

FEDERAL PAYMENT TO THE EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE MAYOR OF THE
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

The bill provides $3,387,500 for a Federal payment to the Execu-
tive Office of the Mayor of the District of Columbia to enhance the
quality of life for District residents. Of this amount $1,250,000
shall be available to temporarily continue Federal benefits for low-
income couples who decide to marry. Additionally, $2,137,500 shall
be available to continue marriage development accounts in the Dis-
trict of Columbia. These funds shall be distributed to the partner-
ship comprised of the National Center for Fathering, Life STARTS
and the Capital Area Asset Building Corporation for continuation
of the Marriage Development Accounts/Pre-marriage Development
Accounts and the Together is Better Campaign Demonstration Pro-
gram in the District of Columbia. The Mayor of the District of Co-
lumbia is directed to submit a detailed spending plan to the House
and Senate Committees on Appropriations, including performance
measures, before these funds may be expended and within 30 days
of enactment of this Act. The Mayor is further directed to submit
a progress report on these activities no later than June 1, 2009 and

a final report describing outcomes achieved no later than February
1, 2010.

DisTrICT OF COLUMBIA FUNDS

The bill provides authority for the District of Columbia to spend
$9,888,095,000 from the General Fund of the District of Columbia.
Of the funds provided, $6,082,474,000 is from local funds, of which
$420,119,000 is from dedicated taxes; $2,177,382,000 is from the
Federal grant funds; $1,621,929,000 is from other funds; and
$6,310,000 is from private funds. In addition, the District may use
$202,326,130 from funds previously appropriated in this Act.

For capital construction, the bill provides an additional
$1,482,977,000. Of the funds provided, $1,121,734,000 is from local
funds, $60,708,000 is from the Highway Trust Fund, $107,794,000
is from the Local Street Maintenance Fund, $37,500,000 is avail-
able from a rescission of Local Street Maintenance Funds, and
$192,741,000 is from Federal grant funds. In addition,
$353,447,000 of prior year local funds are rescinded. In total,
$1,092,030,000 is provided.

Any changes to the financial plan as submitted by the District
must follow the reprogramming guidelines.

TITLE V
INDEPENDENT AGENCIES

ADMINISTRATIVE CONFERENCE OF THE UNITED STATES
SALARIES AND EXPENSES

The bill provides $1,500,000 for the Administrative Conference of
the United States (ACUS). The newly reauthorized ACUS is an
independent agency and advisory committee which was created to
study administrative processes in order to recommend improve-
ments to Congress and agencies.



1014

vironmental Executive are to report on protocols to measure, and
successes in avoiding and reducing, annual greenhouse gas net
emissions, to the Committees on Appropriations by June 1, 2009
and every year thereafter.

Section 749 permanently prohibits funds to pay the salary of an
individual for a position in an acting capacity after the second sub-
mission of a nomination for that individual to that position has
been withdrawn or returned to the President.

Section 750 clarifies references to “this Act”.

Section 751 provides for nonreduction in pay for Federal employ-
ees while serving in the uniformed services or National Guard.

Section 752 requires each agency to submit a report to OMB stat-
ing the total size of its workforce, differentiated by number of civil-
ian, military, and contract workers, and requires OMB to submit
to the Committees on Appropriations a comprehensive statement
delineating the workforce data.

TITLE VIII
GENERAL PROVISIONS—DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

Section 801 specifies that appropriations are made for particular
purposes and shall be considered the maximum for those purposes.

Section 802 authorizes that appropriations are available for trav-
el and dues of organizations.

Section 803 allows for the use of local funds for making refunds
or paying judgments against the District of Columbia government.

Section 804 prohibits Federal funds from being used for propa-
ganda designed to support or defeat legislation before the Congress,
but allows the District of Columbia to use local funds to lobby on
any matter.

Section 805 provides reprogramming and transfer authorities.

Section 806 provides that appropriations under the Act shall be
applied to objects for which the appropriation was made.

Section 807 prohibits the use of Federal funds to implement the
District of Columbia’s Health Care Benefits Act of 1992.

Section 808 makes permanent a provision which allows the
Mayor to accept, obligate and expend Federal, private and other
grants received by the District of Columbia not reflected in the
amounts appropriated in this Act.

Section 809 prohibits Federal funds in the Act to be used for the
expenses of the Shadow Senator or U.S. Representative.

Section 810 provides the parameters for which certain District of
Columbia employees may use a vehicle meant for official duties to
travel to and from work.

Section 811 prohibits the use of Federal funds for a petition or
civil action which seeks to require voting rights for the District of
Columbia in Congress.

Section 812 prohibits Federal funds to be used for needle dis-
tribution, allowing the District of Columbia to utilize local funds for
this purpose.

Section 813 concerns a “conscience clause” on legislation that
pertains to contraceptive coverage by health insurance plans.



1015

Section 814 lifts the cap on funds that can be used to pay the
fees of an attorney in a suit brought against the District of Colum-
bia under the Individuals with Disabilities Act.

Section 815 requires an annual report on crime, access to sub-
stance abuse treatment, management of parolees, education, rat
abatement and indicators of child well-being.

Section 816 makes permanent the provision which allows local
appropriations to be increased by no more than $100,000,000 from
unexpended general funds for certain purposes.

Section 817 makes permanent the provision pertaining to the
spending of “Other-Type Funds” under certain conditions.

Section 818 makes permanent the provision which allows the
Chief Financial Officer to conduct short-term borrowing.

Section 819 prohibits the use of funds in the Act to enact or carry
out any law that legalizes or reduces the penalty for the use of con-
trolled substances.

Section 820 prohibits the use of funds in the Act for abortion
services.

Section 821 allows for the transfer of operating funds to enter-
prise and capital funds.

Section 822 authorizes a pay increase for District of Columbia
Public Defenders.

Section 823 modifies an Act related to the control of wharf prop-
erty and certain public spaces in the District of Columbia.

Section 824 specifies that references to this Act in this title or
title IV are treated as referring only to the provisions of this title
or title IV.

DISCLOSURE OF EARMARKS AND CONGRESSIONALLY
DIRECTED SPENDING ITEMS

Following is a list of congressional earmarks and congressionally
directed spending items (as defined in clause 9 of rule XXI of the
Rules of the House of Representatives and rule XLIV of the Stand-
ing Rules of the Senate, respectively) included in the bill or this ex-
planatory statement, along with the name of each Senator, House
Member, Delegate, or Resident Commissioner who submitted a re-
quest to the Committee of jurisdiction for each item so identified.
Reference in the following table to “The President” is a reference
to President Bush. Neither the bill nor the explanatory statement
contains any limited tax benefits or limited tariff benefits as de-
fined in the applicable House and Senate rules.



SBA Valley Economic Development Center for a Women's Business Center $98,257 | Schiff
SBA Verdugo Workforce Investment Board for assistance to Minority-Owned Businesses $98,257 | Schiff
SBA Village of Olympia Fields for a South Suburban Coalition Economic Development Program $122,821 | Jackson
SBA Virginia's Center for Innovative Technology, Mine safety technology and communication improvements, Herndon, VA $237,500 Webb, Warner
SBA Washington Hancock Community Agency for a Microbusiness Assistance Program, Milbridge, ME $237,500 | Michaud Collins, Snowe
SBA Wayne County, Michigan Aerotropolis Telecommunications Portal and Logistics Center $245,643 | Dingell Levin, Stabenow
SBA Wayne State University for the Law School’s Small Business Clinic $167,676 | Kilpatrick Levin, Stabenow
SBA Western Nevada Development District for small business job creation $300,000 | Heller
SBA William Factory Small Business Incubator $294,772 | Dicks
SBA Women’s Enterprise Development Center Small Business Training $63,867 | Lowey
SBA World Trade Center Utah $385,000 | Bishop (UT) Bennett
SBA Youngstown Warren Regional Chamber for the Salute to Success Program $245,643 | Ryan (OH), Wilson (OH)
SBA YWCA Metropolitan Chicago for an Economic Empowerment Program $122,821 | Jackson
DC | Have A Dream Foundation of Washington DC, Brent Dream Class of 2006 $82,536 | Holmes Norton
DC Boys and Girls Club of Greater Washington for Project Learn $100,000 | Moran (VA), Davis (VA)
DC Capital Area Food Bank Facility Construction $196,514 | Hoyer, Moran (VA), Holmes
Norton
DC Children’s National Medical Center, pediatric surgical center renovations, Washington, DC $2,850,000 | Moran (VA), Van Hollen Cochran
DC DC Campaign for Literacy Education (CYCLE) $82,536 | Holmes Norton
DC Educational Advancement Alliance for the DC Student Support Services Project $245,643 | Fattah
DC Everybody Wins! $225,000 | LaHood

62601



FINANCIAL SERVICES AND GENERAL GOVERNMENT—Continued

Account Project Amount House Senate
DC Excel- Automotive Workforce Development Training Program $294,772 | Knollenberg, Hoyer
DC Georgetown Metro Connection $98,257 | Moran (VA)
DC LifeSTARTS Youth & Family Services, the Capital Area Asset Building Corporation, and the National Center for Fathering $2,137,500 Brownback
to administer Marriage Development Accounts in the District of Columbia
DC National Children’s Alliance $245,643 | Cramer
DC Safe Kids Worldwide, Inc., Child Safety Initiative $368,464 | Wasserman Schultz
DC The Perry School for an Economic Empowerment Program $98,257 | Moran (VA)
GSA Denver Federal Center Remediation $10,472,000 | The President The President
GSA Dirksen Courthouse, Chicago, lllinois $152,825,000 | The President The President
GSA District of Columbia, DHS Consolidation and development of St. Elizabeths Campus $331,390,000 | The President The President
GSA District of Columbia, St. Elizabeths West Campus Infrastructure $8,249,000 | The President The President
GSA District of Columbia, St. Elizabeths West Campus Site Acquisition $7,000,000 | The President The President
GSA Eisenhower Executive Office Building CBR, Washington DC $14,700,000 | The President The President
GSA Eisenhower Executive Office Building Phase Ill, Washington DC $51,075,000 | The President The President
GSA FDA Consolidation, Montgomery County, Maryland $163,530,000 | The President, Hoyer, Ed- | The President, Mikulski,
wards (MD), Van Hollen Cardin
GSA Portal Land Port of Entry, North Dakota $15,204,000 | The President The President
GSA San Diego Courthouse, California $110,362,000 | The President, Davis (CA), | The President, Feinstein,

Filner, Hunter, Issa

Boxer

0€0T





